
Opened 8/13/15 @ 2:00 PM

Reference No.: RFB-15.27 Abrasives

Department: Highway No: 1 2 3 4

Item No. QTY Description
Bid 

Security Y Y Y Y

Stone Dust Furnished  (Price per Ton)

1 Wampsville $7.20 $7.95 $7.60 No Bid

2 Morrisville $7.20 $7.95 $7.60 No Bid

3 Brookfield $7.20 $7.95 $7.60 No Bid

4 DeRuyter $7.20 $7.95 $7.60 No Bid

5 Georgetown $7.20 $7.95 $7.60 No Bid

6 Hamilton $7.20 $7.95 $7.60 No Bid

7 Nelson $7.20 $7.95 $7.60 No Bid

8 Sullivan $7.20 $7.95 $7.60 No Bid

Stone Dust Delivered (Price Per ton)

9 Wampsville $9.70 No Bid $15.10 $15.00

10 Morrisville $10.70 No Bid $11.35 $17.00

11 Brookfield $14.00 No Bid $13.40 $17.00

12 DeRuyter $13.20 No Bid $16.40 $17.00

13 Georgetown $12.70 No Bid $13.10 $18.00

14 Hamilton $12.70 No Bid $12.20 $17.00

15 Nelson $11.70 No Bid $13.60 $17.00

16 Sullivan $11.00 No Bid $16.35 $15.00

Sand Furnished (price per Cubic Yard)

17 Wampsville No Bid $11.15 No Bid $10.00

18 Morrisville No Bid $11.15 No Bid $10.00

19 Brookfield No Bid $11.15 No Bid $10.00

20 DeRuyter No Bid $11.15 No Bid $10.00

21 Georgetown No Bid $11.15 No Bid $10.00

22 Hamilton No Bid $11.15 No Bid $10.00

23 Nelson No Bid $11.15 No Bid $10.00

24 Sullivan No Bid $11.15 No Bid $10.00

Hanson Aggregates 

NY, LLC Riccelli Enterprises

Purchasing Department

Computation of Bids

Madison County 

Callanan 

Industries, Inc. T H Kinsella Inc.
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Sand Delivered (price per Cubic Yard)

25 Wampsville No Bid No Bid No Bid $19.00

26 Morrisville No Bid No Bid No Bid $20.00

27 Brookfield No Bid No Bid No Bid $20.00

28 DeRuyter No Bid No Bid No Bid $22.00

29 Georgetown No Bid No Bid No Bid $22.00

30 Hamilton No Bid No Bid No Bid $22.00

31 Nelson No Bid No Bid No Bid $20.00

32 Sullivan No Bid No Bid No Bid $19.00

6375 Tuttle Road 

Canastota, NY 

13032

Stone dust - 

Fayetteville, NY 
Oriskany Falls Panther Lake Pit

7 AM - 3 PM M- F
7:00:00 AM - 4:15 

PM 

7 AM - 3:30 PM    

M- F
7 AM - 5 PM

Subject to market 

conditions
Usually in stock Stock item

Sand -Delphi, NY

7:00:00 AM - 4:15 

PM 

Usually in stockAvailability

Location of Product

Business Hours

Availability

Location of Product

Business Hours
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