
Opened 12/3/15 @ 3:00 pm

Reference No.: RFB-15.36 GAS PIPING

Department: Landfill No: 1 2 3

Item No. QTY Description
Bid 

Security Y Y Y

1 Pipe- Size (inches) 12, SDR-17 $22,167.60 $20,462.40 $20,129.20

2 Pipe- Size (inches) 12, SDR-17 $19,453.20 $17,956.80 $17,664.40

3 Pipe- Size (inches) 18, SDR-17 $12,559.60 $12,111.42 $11,785.50

4

Pipe- Tie into cells 1-6 Cleanouts Size 

(inches) 18, SDR-17 $14,458.60 $13,942.70 $13,567.50

5 TEE - Size (inches) 6/18, SDR-17 $440.00 $480.12 $450.10

6 TEE - Size (inches) 8/18, SDR-17 $899.25 $1,116.84 $772.20

7 TEE - Size (inches) 6/12, SDR-17 $346.00 $560.70 $340.90

8 TEE - Size (inches) 8/12, SDR-17 $783.00 $841.05 $554.10

9

Flange Adaptor/Back-up Ring -Size 

(inches) 12, SDR-17 $1,056.00 $163.66 $937.50

10

Flange Adaptor/Back-up Ring -Size 

(inches) 12, SDR-17 $528.00 $81.83 $468.70

11

Butterfly Valve w/Back-up Ring -

Size (inches) 12, SDR-17 $2,030.83 $707.65 $2,080.00

12

Butterfly Valve w/Back-up Ring -

Size (inches) 18, SDR-17 $9,618.64 $4,606.42 $9,425.00

13 Pipe- Size (inches) 8, SDR-17 $5,301.80 $4,684.40 $4,713.80

14 Pipe- Size (inches) 8, SDR-17 $3,083.70 $2,724.60 $2,741.70

15 Pipe- Size (inches) 6, SDR-17 $2,580.00 $2,115.00 $2,220.00

16 Pipe- Size (inches) 6, SDR-17 $2,580.00 $2,115.00 $2,220.00

17 WYE - Size (inches) 6, SDR-17 $164.78 $143.36 $152.28

18 WYE - Size (inches) 6, SDR-17 $247.17 $215.04 $228.42

19 WYE - Size (inches) 8, SDR-17 $338.10 $373.78 $219.00

20

Butterfly Valve w/Back-up Ring -

Size (inches) 8, SDR-- $3,818.46 $972.42 $3,645.00
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21

Butterfly Valve w/Back-up Ring -

Size (inches) 8, SDR-- $3,818.46 $972.42 $3,645.00

22

Butterfly Valve w/Back-up Ring -

Size (inches) 6, SDR-- $1,945.84 $390.46 $2,056.66

23

Butterfly Valve w/Back-up Ring -

Size (inches) 6, SDR-- $1,954.84 $390.46 $2,056.66

24

Flange Adaptor/Back-up Ring -Size 

(inches) 8, SDR-17 $509.61 $102.21 $478.98

25

Flange Adaptor/Back-up Ring -Size 

(inches) 8, SDR-17 $509.61 $102.21 $478.98

26

Flange Adaptor/Back-up Ring -Size 

(inches) 6, SDR-17 $339.84 $65.46 $293.52

27

Perforated Pipe -Size (inches) 6, 

SDR-17 $906.24 $174.56 $782.72

28

Perforated Pipe -Size (inches) 6, 

SDR-17 $8,831.92 $6,811.41 $7,269.67

29
Solid Pipe -Size (inches) 6, SDR-17

$7,928.80 $6,114.90 $6,526.30

30

Solid Pipe -Size (inches) 6, SDR- 

17 $963.20 $789.60 $828.80

31
Endcaps -Size (inches) 8, SDR- 17

$963.20 $789.60 $828.80

32
Endcaps -Size (inches) 8, SDR- 17

$238.42 $133.28 $210.77

33 Tee’s -Size (inches) 4/8, SDR- 17 $238.42 $133.28 $210.77

34 Tee’s -Size (inches) 4/8, SDR- 17 $823.55 $1,045.20 $556.78

2 of  8



Opened 12/3/15 @ 3:00 pm

Reference No.: RFB-15.36 GAS PIPING

Department: Landfill No: 1 2 3

Item No. QTY Description
Bid 

Security Y Y Y

Madison County 

Lee Supply  Company Vari-Tech LLC H. D. Supply

Purchasing Department

Computation of Bids

35

Flange Adaptor/Back-up Ring -Size 

(inches) 8, SDR-17 $823.55 $1,045.20 $556.78

36

Flange Adaptor/Back-up Ring -Size 

(inches) 8, SDR-17 $1,189.09 $238.49 $1,117.62

37 Wellheads -Size (inches) -, SDR--- $1,189.09 $238.49 $1,117.62

38 Wellheads -Size (inches) -, SDR--- no bid no bid no bid

39 no bid no bid no bid

40

Perforated Pipe -Size (inches) 8, 

SDR-17 $1,738.80 $1,464.40 $1,688.40

41

Perforated Pipe -Size (inches) 8, 

SDR-17 $2,980.80 $2,510.40 $2,894.40

42
Solid Pipe -Size (inches) 8, SDR-17

$757.40 $669.20 $673.40

43
Solid Pipe -Size (inches) 8, SDR-17

$1,298.40 $1,147.20 $1,154.40

44

Flange Adaptor/Back-up Ring -Size 

(inches) 8, SDR-17 $1,189.09 $238.49 $1,117.62

45

Flange Adaptor/Back-up Ring -Size 

(inches) 8, SDR-17 $2,038.44 $408.84 $1,915.92

46 Tee’s -Size (inches) 4/8, SDR- 17 $823.55 $1,045.38 $556.78

47 Tee’s -Size (inches) 4/8, SDR- 17 $1,411.80 $1,792.08 $954.48

48
Endcaps -Size (inches) 8, SDR- 17

$238.42 $133.28 $210.77

49
Endcaps -Size (inches) 8, SDR- 17

$408.72 $228.48 $361.32

50 Wellheads -Size (inches) -, SDR--- no bid no bid no bid
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51 Wellheads -Size (inches) -, SDR--- no bid no bid no bid

$148,504.79 $115,550.53 $134,859.27Total
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