Madison County
Purchasing Department
Computation of Bids
Jpened 8/7/2014 Hanson Rasmussen
Reference No.: Abrasives 14.23 Aggregates | T H Kinsella | Gravel Products| Callahan
Department: Highway No: 1 2 3 4
Item No. | QTY |Description :::curitv Y Y Y Y

la STONEDUST Wampsville Furnished $7.30 $7.50 no bid $6.90
1b STONEDUST Wampsville Delivered $14.80 no bid no bid $9.40
2a SAND Wampsville Furnished no bid $10.80 $6.00 no bid
2b SAND Wampsville Delivered no bid no bid no bid no bid
lc STONEDUST Morrisville Furnished $7.30 $7.50 no bid $6.90
1d STONEDUST Morrisville Delivered $11.05 no bid no bid $9.40
2c¢ SAND Morrisville Furnished no bid $10.80 $6.00 no bid
2d SAND Morrisville Delivered no bid no bid no bid no bid
le STONEDUST Brookfield Furnished $7.30 $7.50 no bid $6.90
1f STONEDUST Brookfield Delivered $12.90 no bid no bid $13.70
2e SAND Brookfield Furnished no bid $10.80 $6.00 no bid
2f SAND Brookfield Delivered no bid no bid no bid no bid
lg STONEDUST Deruyter Furnished $7.30 $7.50 no bid $6.90
1h STONEDUST Deruyter Delivered $16.10 no bid no bid $12.60
2g SAND Deruyter Furnished no bid $10.80 $6.00 no bid
2h SAND Deruyter Delivered no bid no bid no bid no bid
1i STONEDUST Georgetown Furnished $7.30 $7.50 no bid $6.90
1] STONEDUST Georgetown Delivered $12.80 no bid no bid $12.40
2i SAND Georgetown Furnished no bid $10.80 $6.00 no bid
2j SAND Georgetown Delivered no bid no bid no bid no bid
1k STONEDUST Hamilton Furnished $7.30 $7.50 no bid $6.90
11 STONEDUSTHamilton Delivered $11.80 no bid no bid $12.40
2k SAND Hamilton Furnished no bid $10.80 $6.00 no bid
21 SAND Hamilton Delivered no bid no bid no bid no bid
1m STONEDUST Nelson Furnished $7.30 $7.50 no bid $6.90
1n STONEDUST Nelson Delivered $13.30 no bid no bid $11.20
2m SAND Nelson Furnished no bid $10.80 $6.00 no bid
2n SAND Nelson Delivered no bid no bid no bid no bid
lo STONEDUST Sullivan Furnished $7.30 $7.50 no bid $6.90
1p STONEDUST Sullivan Delivered $16.05 no bid no bid $10.40
20 SAND Sullivan Furnished no bid $10.80 $6.00 no bid
2p SAND Sullivan Delivered no bid no bid no bid no bid
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